
 

 

 

 

 

 

Novena to the Sacred Heart of Jesus 
 

Prayer to the Sacred Heart of Jesus 

O most Sacred Heart of Jesus, fountain of every blessing, We adore You, we love 

You and with a true sorrow for my sins, we offer You this poor heart of mine. Make 

us humble, patient, pure and wholly obedient to Your will. Grant good Jesus that 

we may live in You and for You. Protect us in the midst of danger, comfort us in my afflictions,  

give me health of body, assistance in my temporal needs, Your blessing on all that we do, 

and the grace of a holy death. Amen. 

 















 
 
In the name of the Father, the Son and the Holy Ghost. AMEN 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Background on the Devotion to the Sacred Heart  
 
Christ appeared to Saint Mary Margaret Alacoque, a nun of the Order of the Visitation, that he  
wished the devotion and feast of His Sacred Heart should be established and propagated in the 
Church. in order that devout souls should by their adoration and prayer make reparation for the 
injuries His heart constantly receives from ungrateful men when He is exposed in the Sacrament 
upon the Altar.  
 
It is also related in the life of Saint Mary Margaret Alacoque, written by Monseigneur Languet, 
Bishop of Sens, that while this devout virgin was one day praying before the Most Holy 
Sacrament, Jesus Christ showed her His Heart surrounded by thorns, with a cross on the top and 
in a throne of flames; and then He said thus to her: "Behold the heart that has so much loved 
men, and has spared nothing for love of them, even to consuming itself to give them pledges of its 
love, but which receives from the majority of men no other recompense but ingratitude, and 
insults towards the Sacrament of love; and what grieves Me most is, that these hearts are 
consecrated to Me." And then He desired her to use her utmost endeavors in order that a 
particular feast should be celebrated in honor of His Divine Heart on the first Friday after the 
Octave of Corpus Christi. And this for three reasons:  
 
1. In order that the faithful should return thanks to Him, for the great gift which He has left them 
in the adorable Eucharist;  
 
2. In order that loving souls should make amends by their prayers and pious affections for the 
irreverences and insults which He has received and still receives from sinners in this Most Holy 
Sacrament;  
 
3. In order that they might make up also for the honor which He does not receive in so many 
churches where He is so little adored and reverenced. And He promised that He would make the 
riches of His Sacred Heart abound towards those who should render Him this honor, both on the 
day of this feast, and on every other day when they should visit Him in the Most Holy 
Sacrament. 
 
 
This devotion to the Sacred Heart of Jesus Christ is nothing more than an exercise of love 
towards Christ. But as to the principal object of this devotion, the spiritual object is the love with 
which the Heart of Jesus Christ is inflamed towards men, because love is generally attributed to 
the heart, as we read in many places of Scripture: 
 
“My son, give Me thy heart. [Prov. xxiii. 26]  
 
My heart and my flesh have rejoiced in the living God. [Ps. lxxxiii. 3]  
 
The God of my heart, and the God that is my portion forever. [Ps. lxxii. 26]  
 
The charity of God is poured forth in our hearts by the Holy Ghost Who is given to us. [Rom. v. 
5]  


